
Bend sarah.sage@bbklaw.com (541) 318-9833

Sarah Sage is a paralegal in Best Best & Krieger’s
Trusts & Estates group. Sarah has worked in the legal
field for over 20 years. At the start of her career, she
worked extensively in litigation and as a trial paralegal.
Most recently, she has focused on estate planning,
trusts and probates. 

 

Sarah began her career working for a sole practitioner
where she learned best practices in client-centric work
and communications. This client-centric mindset is
today one of Sarah’s core values, as she has
continued on in her roles serving both large
corporations and individuals. She strives to work as a
team with her attorneys while bringing the best work
product and customer service possible to her clients.

 

While concentrating on estate planning and probates,
Sarah has had the opportunity to assist clients with tax
planning, complex family dynamics and emotional post
death processes. Working with clients through each of
these phases allows her to see the big picture while
also working through the details. 

 

Sarah lives in Washington with her husband, two
stepsons and two black labs. She enjoys everything
outdoors, including hiking, biking, skiing and paddle
boarding. When the weather doesn’t allow for these
activities, she can be found with a cup of coffee and a
good book or playing a board game with her family.


 

CORE PRACTICES
Trusts & Estates

EDUCATION & ADMISSIONS
Education

Portland State University, B.A.,
psychology, with honors

LANGUAGES
English
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*Paralegals are not licensed attorneys. Under California law, paralegals are not authorized to provide
legal advice.

 

bbklaw.com

Sarah Sage


